
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  

FAMILY CAMP FAQS 
Luther Park Bible Camp, 944 24 ¼ Street, Chetek, WI 54728      
www.lutherpark.org    715.859.2215 

 

HEALTH AND SAFETY ANSWERS: 

 

Will we be safe? The staff is highly trained. There are 
Emergency Responders available 24 hours a day no 
matter where you or your children are. There are 
trained lifeguards at the pool and trained counselors at 
the recreation areas.  
 

What do I do with the Camper Health Form you sent 
me? If you are bringing a camper that you are NOT the 
legal guardian of, then you need to have a Camper 
Health Form filled out by the legal guardian of the 
camper in order to allow the camper to stay at camp. 
Luther Park cannot allow any child to stay at camp 
without his/her legal guardian unless a current health 
history form is filled out and signed by his/her legal 
guardian. Please mail this form in two weeks before the 
start of camp, or bring the signed form with you to camp 
at check-in time. 
 

Does the child need a physical by a physician? We 
recommend one every two years but it is not required. 
 

What about Insurance? Each camper is covered 
primarily by their own insurance and secondarily by 
Luther Park’s Accident Insurance Policy. 

 

WE ARE EXCITED YOUR FAMILY WILL BE JOINING US FOR FAMILY CAMP 2017! 

Here are sine FAQ’s about just Family Camp. Please take a look at the camper handbook for 
more information about Luther Park in the Summer and additional FAQ’s about camp in general. 
The Camper Handbook is downloadable on our website or if you registered online your 

confirmation email has one attached.  

 
 

ARRIVAL ANSWERS: 

 

What time do we arrive? Sunday between 3-4 PM 

 

What will happen when I get there? There will be 
counselors to greet you in the Welcome Center parking 
lot. You will then need to check-in. At check-in you will 
be given a place to stay and a counselor for the week. 

 

Where do we check in? Check-in is located at the 
Welcome Center 

 

Do I need to check in at registration even if I have 
already paid? Yes, checking in helps us to know who all 
has arrived. 

 

Can I park my car in front of my cabin? The road in 
between cabins is an EMERGENCY fire route and cannot 
be blocked by camper vehicles for the safety of all 
campers at camp. We ask families to unload and park 
vehicles in the Welcome Center parking lot. Counselors 

are available to help unload. 

DEPARTURE ANSWERS: 

 

What time do we depart? Friday at 12:00 PM. You can 
invite friends to the closing worship at 11:00 AM if you 
would like.  
 

What if I leave something at Luther Park? We highly 
recommend labeling all of your belongings so that if 
something is lost, others will know who to return it to 
you throughout the week. Please check for Lost and 
found items on display at the Dining Hall during 
departure times. We only keep items for two weeks and 
then they are given to a local charity.  
 

LOCATION ANSWERS: 
 

Where is Luther Park? 

MONEY AND MISCELLANEOUS ANSWERS 

CONTINUED ON REVERSE 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 

MISCELLANEOUS ANSWERS: 

 

Can we bring bicycles? Yes! Don’t forget a helmet! 
 

Will I be able to have a nap? Yes! You are given a 
counselor for the week to play with and entertain 
campers of all ages! 
 

What if I have a food allergy? Please notify Luther Park 
in advance and we will accommodate you to the best of 
our ability. 
 

Where will we be staying and can we bring bedding 
instead of sleeping bags? All beds at Luther Park are 
twin sizes and you may bring bedding instead of sleeping 
bags. If you are staying in the platform tents we 
recommend a sleeping bag. 
 

Do I need to bring towels, washcloths, and soap? Yes.  
 

Will my family be together for Bible study? We split up 
Bible Study based upon the age of the individual. The 
adults will be together and the children will be divided 
into smaller age-appropriate groups.  
 

May I bring my guitar? Yes, feel free to bring a musical 
instrument and share your talents! 
 

What if I don’t know the songs? The counselors teach 
all of the songs multiple times. Some songs will also be 
projected during worship.  
 

May I bring my fishing pole? Yes, but don’t forget your 
Wisconsin license! The DNR does patrol the lake. 
 

What kind of food is served? You can expect healthy, 
large, balanced meals. There is a cereal bar served with 
every breakfast and a salad bar with every lunch and 
supper.  
 

MONEY ANSWERS: 

 

If I cancel, will I get my deposit refunded? The 
required deposit is non-refundable and non-transferable 
after May 1. If cancellation occurs prior to May 1, the 
deposit will be refunded less a $25 processing fee.  
 

When is the rest of my payment due? If possible, 
please mail the final payment at least two weeks in 
advance, or you may pay it when you arrive on Sunday.  
 

What if my family cannot afford to come to Luther 
Park? If you need a campership or know someone who 
does, please download a form at lutherpark.org or call 
us. We make every effort to ensure that no one is turned 
away from Luther Park because of inability to pay. We 
are very grateful to all the people who make it possible 
for all campers to come to camp through generous 
financial gifts.  
 

When is the canteen open? The canteen is open at 
check-in and departure. Also, it is open once in the 
afternoon and once again in the evening while you are 
here. 
 

What is the canteen procedure? You will be able to 
deposit money into your Canteen Account upon arrival at 
camp. Canteen accounts eliminate the need to carry any 
money at camp. Whatever you buy during the week will 
be subtracted from your account. Any money left in your 
account will be reimbursed on Friday when you leave.  
 

Do we pay for crafts? All craft materials are included 
except if you want to purchase an item to tie dye (or 
bring your own).  
 

May I use a credit card? Yes, we accept Discover, 
MasterCard, and Visa. 
 

 

Luther Park Bible Camp 
944 24 ¼ Street 
Chetek, WI 54728 
www.lutherpark.org 
715.859.2215 


